

**PURCHASE OF LAPTOPS
ITB 16.2021**

Bid Opening: October 1, 2020

BIDDER	MANUF	MODEL	UNIT COST 5 YR warranty	DEDUCT			ADD ALT 4 YR 2 BATT. WARR	NOTES
				ALT 1 YR 5 WARR = 4 YR TOTAL unless indicated	ALT 2 3-CELL BATT.	ALT 3 128 GB SSD		
CDW-G	HP	Probook 430 G7	\$ 999.00	\$ (385.00)	\$ 0.00	\$ (12.00)	\$ 25.00	no 4 cell battery 1 yr warr, no acc damage
Inacomp	HP	Probook 430 G7	\$ 834.00	\$ (134.00)	\$ 0.00	\$ (21.00)	\$ 15.00	no 4 cell battery Add Alt is a 3 yr warranty Included 100 labor hrs, reduce bill if use less hrs
Marco	Lenovo	ThinkPad E14 Gen2 (AMD)	\$ 1,001.80	\$ (75.47)	\$ 0.00	not available	\$ 26.28	no Acc Dam No SD card reader, no 4 cell Add Alt is a 3 yr warranty Onsite Premier Support at extra cost
Presidio	Dell	Latitude 3310	\$ 646.50	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
Prosys	Lenovo	ThinkPad L13	\$ 845.83	\$ (134.38)	\$ 0.00	\$ (25.20)	\$ 18.89	no 4 cell. No Acc Dam on any options 3 yr warr, no Acc Dam Add Alt is a 3 yr warranty
Sehi	HP	Probook 430 G7	\$ 797.00	\$ (131.37)	\$ 0.00	\$ (3.00)	\$ 15.00	no 4 cell battery
Sehi	HP	Probook 430 G7 i3	\$ 747.00	\$ (131.37)	\$ 0.00	\$ (3.00)	\$ 15.00	no 4 cell battery
Sehi	HP	Probook 440 G7	\$ 826.00	\$ (131.37)	\$ 0.00	\$ (3.00)	\$ 15.00	no 4 cell battery
Sehi	HP	Probook X360 11 G5 EE	\$ 752.00	\$ (131.37)	\$ 0.00	\$ (3.00)	\$ 15.00	no 4 cell battery
Trinity3 Technology	Lenovo	ThinkPad L13	\$960.00	\$ (260.00)	not available	no bid	\$23.00	No intune services Add Alt is a total of 4 yr warranty
Trinity3 Technology	Lenovo	ThinkPad L13 - Plat Warr	\$895.00	no bid	not available	no bid		Plat Warr- unlimited # of Acc Damage, 5 yr batt warranty, theft loss 3 yr warr, no Acc Dam
Virtucom	HP	Probook 430 G7	\$798.00	-\$54.00	N/A	-\$12.00	\$18.00	
Virtucom	HP	Probook 445 G7	\$674.00	-\$55.00	N/A	-\$12.00	\$18.00	
Y & S Technologies	Lenovo	ThinkPad L13	\$ 897.00	\$ (194.00)	not available	\$ (27.00)	\$ 17.00	Add Alt is a 3 yr warranty 3 yr warr, no Acc Dam Alt Imaging Option \$13.22